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recovery noted. Finally, Hanselman et al. [11] presented a case of a 54-
year old man involving correction of a 29° varus deformity to 2° varus
at 8-months follow-up without peri-articular osteotomy. They
employed an INBONE™ II total ankle system with PROPHECY™
computed-tomography-derived patient-specific cutting guides (Wright
Medical Technology, Inc., Arlington, TN) and lateral ankle
stabilization alone.

The author presents a case involving a failed Agility™ LP total ankle
replacement system (DePuy Synthes Joint Reconstruction, Warsaw, IN)
with severe > 40° varus ankle deformity that was corrected with
explantation and conversion to INBONE™ II total ankle replacement
system and soft-tissue release/reconstruction employing percutaneous
Achilles tendon lengthening, posterior tibial tendon intramuscular
recession lengthening and modified Evans peroneus longus lateral
ankle stabilization. Additionally, prophylactic tarsal tunnel release was
performed to reduce potential for post-operative nerve compression.

Case Study
A 54-year old man was evaluated in January 2007 by a foot and

ankle orthopaedic surgeon at the author’s institution for chronic right

ankle pain. The ankle pain stemmed from a severe inversion ankle
injury in 1975 followed by a series of inversion ankle sprains over the
ensuing years that culminated with a severe injury occurring when he
slipped on an icy dock at work around 1995 that never healed properly.
Subsequent to the last severe inversion injury, he had chronic right
ankle pain and instability even on flat ground that precluded him from









Webril Undercast Padding limits contact pressure on the tenuous
anterior incision and the Sir Robert Jones dressing affords edema
reduction during the postoperative period. A standard post-operative
protocol for TAR was employed [24] that includes: hospital admission,
48-hours of intravenous antibiotic therapy with a first generation
cephalosporin, strict bed rest protocol with lower extremities elevated
above heart level and heels offloaded using pillow cocoon and a semi-
Fowler bed positioning protocol. Although anecdotal, supplemental
oxygen via nasal cannula during the hospitalization was employed as it
may reduce incision and ischemia-related wound healing problems.
The patient was maintained on a strict mechanical and pharmacologic
thromboembolic prophylaxis protocol until return to full

weightbearing and activity was realized at 12-weeks. He then
transitioned to full weightbearing and back into a supportive lace-up
high-topped boot with fixed angle ankle-foot orthosis employed for 1-
year post-operative. An annual surveillance program employed by the
author ensued. Although controversial, dental antibiotic prophylaxis
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