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Discussion
�e major �nding of this study is that it is not necessarily recruiting 

or weight loss success that delays study completion or complicates a 
weight loss study in otherwise healthy obese women. We found that 
retention during the weight loss program was the primary reason for 
delay in completing the study, but the reasons for attrition were not as 
usually expected (i.e., weight loss success). Besides meeting recruitment 
projections, investigators must set reasonable study schedules and 
accurately anticipate the impact of exclusion rates, withdrawals, study 
burden demands, con�icts with participant employment, facility 
locations, family interactions, and related medical issues, which all can 
a�ect study attrition rates [1,3,12]. Overall, recruitment was not a 
limiting factor in the study, although we did have to consent many 
more participants than we originally anticipated. �e expenses related 
to participant compensation and extended sta� salary support were 
increased due to these problems. Detailed attention to developing an a 
priori recruitment plan including both passive and active recruiting 

might have helped us with the initial recruitment e�orts [1]. A better 
understanding of the number of participants we would lose before 
beginning the weight loss program would have been helpful in planning 
the timing of the study and in estimating the budget. Another problem 
we identi�ed in the beginning of the study was that it took a month or 
more to complete pre-testing of a participant before we could get them 
entered into the weight loss program. We had estimated that each 
participant would have at least one test per week and would enter the 
weight loss program within one month of consenting. �is turned out 
not to be reasonable since not every participant could complete one test 
per week due to other commitments; thus pre-testing could take more 
than a month to complete. We also needed to get a meal plan ordered 
and delivered to the participant before meeting with the trainer. 
Furthermore, it took time to schedule meeting times with the dietician 
and the individual trainers, and to schedule appointments for the 
magnetic resonance imaging (i.e., body composition measurements), 
which we had not appropriately projected. Moreover, we extended the 
weight loss program for some participants (N = 3) to give them more 
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time to obtain the weight loss goal, which also delayed the completion 
of the study. Since the goal of our study was not to test the intent-to-
treat obesity but to investigate the e�ects of weight loss on breathlessness 
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show of support, and to generate more enthusiasm for the participants’ 
successful loss of weight and healthy change of lifestyle. We wonder in 
hindsight whether some type of behavioral counseling might have 
helped the participants deal with the stress of participating in such an 
extensive program and with changes in eating behavior (i.e., not only 
for the participant but for the family). �is aspect of physiological 
studies receives little attention but may have made this a much easier 
trial to complete. Lastly, the research sta� also had more meetings with 
the training sta� to get their feedback and suggestions, and to review 
objectives of the study and to show them preliminary results. All these 
changes may have helped keep unsuccessful weight loss to a minimum 
during the study, although we had anticipated that this would be our 
largest problem. 

Conclusion 
In conclusion, recruiting and/or weight loss success may not present 

the most challenging aspects of completing a weight loss intervention 
study. Participant attrition during a weight loss program can occur for 
a wide range of other reasons including study burden, con�icts with 
participant employment, facility location, personal family interactions, 
behavioral issues, and unrelated medical issues. Many of these 
concerns may be combated during the consenting process and during 
early phases of the trial through increased investigator-participant 
interactions.
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