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Introduction
Several studies have suggested an effect of ECVE on cultured lung 

cells, ranging from increased inflammation, measured by increased 
cytokine production, to changes in the microvasculature. Increased 
cytokine production and evidence of lung injury has also been observed 
following exposure of mice to e-cig vapour and nicotine, together with 
a reduced capacity to clear either bacterial or viral infection [1]. These 
findings suggest an inflammatory lung environment similar to that 
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exposure to e-cig vapour resulted in increased IL- 8 levels compared to 
cigarette smoke. Levels of TNF-α were similarly increased following 
e-cig vapour exposure with H.influenza, S. pneumonia and S.aureus. 
These data indicate that bacteria exposed to cigarette smoke promote a 
greater inflammatory response in A549 cells than in non-exposed 
bacteria, but that this is closely matched and in some cases exceeded by 
the level of inflammation observed following exposure to e-cig vapour. 
Altered immune responses, which promote bacterial persistence, have 
previously been observed with S. pneumonia, following airway cell-
cigarette smoke exposure and with cigarette smoke - exposed MRSA. 
MRSA exposure to e-cig vapour has also been described as altering 
immune-modulatory cytokines in the airways of mice. Our findings 
expand on this work to show that exposure of other key respiratory 
pathogens to both cigarette smoke and, in particular, e-cig vapour has 
the potential to modulate host response to infection and we speculate 
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